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splendid example of how longitudinal fieldwork highly improves our an-
thropological understanding of the dynamics of change.

The narrative and debating style of the book opens up much for the 
reader to think about. In his endeavour to be all-embracing and all-
inclusive, Canessa says it all, and convincingly, too. He gives many per-
spectives, lets many voices speak, tells many case histories, all in great de-
tail. But in the end the reader tends to feel a bit overwhelmed and in need of
some guidance. What is Canessa’s conclusion about twenty years of field-
work? Each chapter ends with a few summarizing words, but instead of a 
firm concluding chapter the author has chosen to write a post script. How-
ever interesting the post script is, the lack of solid conclusions feels like an 
omission. On the other hand, perhaps twenty years of intense and engaged 
fieldwork is just too much to distil into one chapter of conclusions to guide 
the reader. In any case, it is a wonderful book for anyone interested in Bo-
livia, Andean culture, Aymara people, ethnicity, fieldwork experiences or 
anthropology in general. Just read it and let yourself be amazed.

Annelou Ypeij, CEDLA, Amsterdam

– ¡Américas Unidas! Nelson A. Rockefeller’s Office of Inter-American Af-
fairs (1940-1946), edited by Gisela Cramer and Ursula Prutsch. Frank-
furt: Vervuert, 2012.

Gisela Cramer and Ursula Prutsch are two of today’s leading experts on the 
history and workings of the Office of Inter-American Affairs (OIAA), a 
federal agency established by Franklin D. Roosevelt to bolster Good 
Neighbour cultural and economic ties between the United States and Latin 
America and insure hemispheric solidarity during World War II. Their co-
edited volume is an important and timely addition to discussions of the 
OIAA as an example of the United States’ first full-scale effort at cultural 
diplomacy. Building their long-standing contacts with other academic spe-
cialists, the editors have succeeded in bringing together a collection of en-
gaging, informative and well-written commentaries that analyse the agen-
cy’s work in motion pictures, print and broadcast media, the arts, as well as 
in fields such as public health.

The editors’ incisive introduction provides a historical context for the 
individual studies and addresses recent debates about the means and ends of 
public diplomacy and initiatives like the OIAA, which today are described 
in terms of soft power. However, the editors also call attention to the agen-
cy’s oftentimes hard edge approach to cultural exchange – an exchange 
that, depending on the circumstances, could deliver a body blow to a na-
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tion’s economy. Depriving the Argentine movie industry of film stock and 
access to profitable Hollywood movies is one example of the economic 
hardball that the OIAA was willing to play to show its dissatisfaction with 
Argentina’s neutrality during the war. As Uwe Lübken’s shows in his essay 
on the Nazi threat in Latin America, given the 1936 non-interventionist 
agreement signed by all the Americas, the OIAA’s ‘cultural game’ became 
an important means for the U.S. to continue to exercise its power and influ-
ence in the hemisphere. 

What forms did that influence take? As Pennee Bender notes, the OIAA 
invested heavily in 16mm educational films to teach Latin Americans about 
the ‘American way of life’ and to instruct U.S. audiences about neighbours 
to the south. Similarities were touted over differences among the twenty-
one republics with emphasis on the modern and progressive aspects of 
hemispheric life. While the 16mm project was under way, the OIAA sent
goodwill ambassadors Walt Disney and Orson Welles to Latin America to 
meet people and make movies. Catherine L. Benamou analyses the differ-
ent strategies of the two directors. While Disney made colourful cartoon 
features and shorts that charmed audiences with funny and endearing char-
acters like Zé Carioca, Welles took to the streets of Rio de Janeiro to film 
carnival and made his way to the impoverished Northeast to recreate an 
epic journey on a raft by four fishermen. Disney’s future ‘magic kingdom’
was secured because of his successful alliance with the OIAA/ RKO Studi-
os and other war-time agencies, whereas RKO cut Welles’s funds for his 
documentary It’s All True because of his focus on poor, dark-skinned Bra-
zilians – an emphasis that also displeased Brazilian president-turned-
dictator Getúlio Vargas, who preferred to project an image of Brazil as 
white and middle-class. 

José Luis Ortiz Garza’s essay is a compelling account of the OIAA’s
investments to modernize the Mexican press, and its questionable tactics to 
win over resistance and gain influence, including threats to cut off the na-
tion’s paper supply. Gisela Cramer examines in detail the agency’s attempts 
to influence the Argentine airwaves in the face of resistance to certain 
OIAA programming that was unpopular with local audiences. She shows 
that, ironically, the battle for Argentine radio dominance came down to a 
struggle not between the Axis and Allied powers, but rather between the 
OIAA radio division and the BBC, which was losing ground to U.S. pro-
gramming. In her essay on Brazil, Ursula Prutsch examines the extent to 
which the OIAA served the nationalist project or brasilidade of Vargas, 
who negotiated the construction of the Volta Redondo steel mill and in-
vestments in public health in exchange for U.S. naval and air bases in the 
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Brazilian Northeast and access to rubber in the Amazon Basin. Several of 
the articles address the work of the agency’s numerous regional coordina-
tion committees, whose membership was largely composed of U.S. busi-
nessmen who lived in Latin America. In his essay, Thomas M. Leonard 
provides important and little-known information on these committees in 
Central America and their use of mass media and special public relations 
projects to promote goodwill in the region. Catha Paquette’s article com-
ments on OIAA traveling exhibits of U.S. and Latin American art to forge 
better hemispheric relations; although there were differences of opinion 
within the agency about the desirability of showing modern urban images 
of Latin America over rural indigenous ones, the OIAA exhibits attracted 
large audiences both north and south and were helpful in demonstrating that 
the U.S. had interests beyond those associated with business and industry. 

¡Américas Unidas! is an impressive work of scholarship and essential
reading for specialists and students interested in U.S.-Latin American rela-
tions, World War II, the culture industry and foreign diplomacy. Although 
the book would have benefitted from an index, its availability in both Eng-
lish and Spanish-language versions (Madrid: Iberoamericana) is a boon for 
its many prospective readers.

Darlene J. Sadlier, Indiana University-Bloomington

– How a Revolutionary Art became Official Culture: Murals, Museums, 
and the Mexican State, by Mary Coffey. Durham, NC: Duke University 
Press, 2012.

Aunque en México el término muralismo suele remitir al arte público desa-
rrollado en la década de 1920, cuando arte y gobierno parecían convergir en 
intereses y acciones, el apoyo sistemático del Estado federal a los artistas 
ocurrirá, en realidad, mucho más tarde, entre 1940 y 1968, principalmente. 
La periodización propuesta en este trabajo abre una veta de investigación al 
considerar al Maximato (1929-34), no como el fin de un ciclo (del mura-
lismo revolucionario), sino como un punto de partida para un periodo y un 
tema menos estudiado que podría llamarse ‘Muralismo Revolucionario 
Institucional’.

No se cuenta la historia de la conversión de los murales más conocidos 
de Palacio Nacional o de San Ildefonso en íconos solidificados de la retóri-
ca nacionalista postrevolucionaria. Se trata de otro conjunto de obras que 
desde su concepción misma fueron pensadas para exhibirse en tres museos 
particularmente importantes por su riqueza material y por su función como 
vitrinas del Estado: el Palacio de Bellas Artes (1934-1960, Capítulo 1), el 


